Proforma Tax Invoice

DELNET-Developing Library Network

JNU Campus,Nelson Mandela Road,Vasant Kun]

New Delhi-110070

GSTIN/UIN: 07AAAAD2288G1ZV

Email: sangskaul2003@yahoo.co.in
Ph.No.+91-11-26742222,2674 1232
Fax. +91-11-26741122

Invoice No
2024 64337

Date
23-January-2024

Membership No.
IM-8984

Mode Of Payment
DD/Multicity-Cheque/NEFT

Reference No:

Kottayam
Pin: 686631
Kerala

]
| Mangalam College of Engineering

é Mangalam Hills, Vettimukkal P.O.Ettumanoor
E

| GSTINUIN:
. |s.No

Particulars

GST RATE Amount ¥

Scan & Pay DELNET Bank Details

i[W] A/C Holder Name: DELNET
et ,.:.:' 5 E'- Bank Name: Central Bank Of India
: qa-&l - Branch:Khan Market,New Delhi-110003
¥ _'-_"E Alc No:- 1065410992 (Saving Account)
IFSC CODE: CBIN0280310

1 Annual Institutional Membership Fees (for the period 21.02.2024 to 20.02.2025)
IGST * 2070.00

18% 11,500.00

Total.

I  13,570.00

Amount Chargeable (in words)

T THIRTEEN THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED SEVENTY ONLY

E.&0O.E

=

Tax Amount (in words)

""SAC CODE:- 998431

Taxable Value

Integrated Tax

11500.00

Rate Amount
18% 2070.00

J TWO THOUSAND SEVENTY ONLY

Remarks:

DELNET's PAN

For Bank Transfer

AAAAD2288G

Kindly remit the amount through NEFT/RTGS only.DO NOT DEPOSIT THE CASH DIRECTLY TO DELNET BANK A/C.

for DELNET- Developing Library Network

Authorised Signatory.

DD/CHEQUE SHOULD BE IN FAVOUR OF “"DELNET". The DD should be made payable at “New Delhi" bank branch.
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N0 Receipt NO.78701/2023-24 , Uated 7-Feb-24

DELNET- Developing Library Network

b Jawaharlal Nehru University Campus
4‘ Nelson Mandela Road. Vasant Kunj
: New Delhi-110070
bi State Name : Delhi, Code . 07

Receipt

Received wilh thanks from : MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING
MANGALAM HILLS, VETTIMUKKAL P.O.
ETTUMANOOR, KOTTAYAM-686631, KERALA
[DELNET MEM. NO. IM-8984)

The sum of : Indian Rupees Thirteen Thousand Five Hundred Seventy Only
By . MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING; QDFC Bank {India)

Inter Bank Transfer Ve 5-Feb-24 13,570.00
Remarks - AMOUNT RECEIVED TOWARDS ANNUAL INSTITUTIONAL MEMBERSHIP FEE

FOR THE PERICD 21.02.2024 TO 20.02.2025

**% 13,570.00/- Auti

**Subject lo Realisation

7,

N PRINCIPAL

=" MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING
Ettumanoor
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Mangnalam College of Englnaarlug Admin <mangalam@kiu odu In>

Senl tram my 1IPhone

Begin forwanded message

]
]
:
%

From: Mangalam College of Engineenng Admin <mangataniih o e
Date 1 Apnl 2023 al 4 00 48 PM IST
To: Prancipal MLMCE <pnes sl mangatam in>

Jo Libranan Engineenng <libranani@manpalam in>, Benphil C Mathew <benphil mathew@mangalam >

mn>

Subject: Fwd: Subscription to Elsevier, Turnitin and Knimbus Packages on subsldised price.

o)

Longehoan Hills
ety o)
Lokt & ¥ |
Emal oo vEngalanion
Websie vwirw mangalam, ac i
Tel 2 b REESTAT 2RAT O
Fax i

Forwarded message ——

From Dr. Shalij P R Dean Research - APJAKTU <deanresearch@ktu.edu.in>

Date Sal. Apr 1, 2023 at 11:26 AM

Subject. Subscription lo Elsevier, Turnitin and Knimbus Packages on subsidised price.

To: KTU Affiiated Colleges <culleges@kiu.edu in>
Cc: Statutory Officers <statutaryofficers@klu.edu.in>

Dear sir / madam,

Greelings from APJ Abdul Kalam Technological Universily.

i i Librarlan Mangalam College Of Englinearing <librarlan@mangalam.in>

Fwd: Subscription to Elsevler, Turnitin and Knimbus Packages on subsidised price.

Mon. Apr 3. 2023 a1 10 271 PM

p ' The Universily has subscribed lo 297 Elsevior Journals, Turnilin - Plagiarism Checking Tool and Knimbus - an enabling teol for
g accessing contents in mobile phones - and given access Lo 60 colleges free of cost during the AY 2022-23.

The subscription 1o these (ools will be provided by the University on a cosl sharing basis, to the AY 2023-24. The subsidised price
the suppliecs offer Lo Universily is around 50% of the unil price. 25% of the subsidised price is €Xpactad (5 be borne by the

Institution

Package subscription Subsidized Unit Price (Rs.)|Share from Institution (Rs.)

Elsevier - 297 lournals 4,05,000.00 1,10,000.00

Turnitin - Plagiarism Checking tool - 1100 Licenses per college 3,50,991.91 90,000.00

Knimbus 78,666.67 20,000.00
Total 2,20,000.00

Please see a google form o inform your willingness for availing lhe su

bscriplion of Ihe packages. Please fillup the form befors 10ih

April 2023

S Auees G ML A 20T M iRe

You will be able (o fillup Ine form using the «' i+ email id provided Lo Lhe afliflalgd mslitutions
Regardy

Or Shaly P K

Dean Research
._h_«FJ Abdul Kalaim Technulogival Uiiversity
hiruvananthapuranm, Kerata, India

PRINCIPAL

'MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING

Ettumanoor
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Liarian Mangalam Collage Of Englnesring <Hbraclangdmangialam (n»

Fwd: Payment Status of Turnitin Journal Subscription Fee for MANGALAM
COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING

A EERE RS 16 Ty

Princtpal MLMCE « principal@mangalam in> Frl, Sap 16 2023 at 4 37 FM
To Libranan Mangalam College Of Engineeting «librariangamangalam in>

Lroetings

Dr. Vinodh P VijJayan Ph.D | PRINCIPAL

3 MANGALAM

COM O TNGINGE RING

Vettimukal P O. Mangalam Hills
Ettumanoor, Kottayam, Kerala, Indla-686631

LER TN

alal

A G
g <
M b
Email procy ol comangalam i
erahe e ayangdmangalam.an

DodEpayanB T gegmail com
Ph # +91 9961687007
Website: vu, aangalan o
Tel: 0481-2533711, 2533722, 2537053

[=15 ]

LR

Forwarded message —-------

From < craumcation_supportcklu edu.n>

8 Dale Fri, Sep 15, 2023 al 4:32PM 4
Subject Payment Status of Turnitin Journal Subscriplion Fee for MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING
To <atwiticnn betisseryapguiall com>, <neema george@mangalam in>, <principal@mangalam >

Dear Swiladam,

Thank you for making a payment of INR 90000.00/ as Turnitin Journal Subscription Fee to the APJ Abdul Kalam
Technological University m— i

Thanks,
KTU e-Gov Plalform Suppon Team.
AP J Abdul Kalam Technological Universily Technical Support Team.

PRINCIPAL
GALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING
Ettumanoor

g el e dlen fe
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L) § ke

PAYMENT TRANSACTION RECEIPT

Reterence \d: MP_KTU1211747 Date: 15/09/2023

Received with thanks from MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING

an amount of INR 9000000 for  Subscription Fee For Turnitin Journals ( E-

Joumnal Subscription For Affiliated Institutions 2023-2024)

APJ Abdul Kalam Technological University

rsle-a86 831/ PRINCIPAL

RN MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING
ki Ettumanoor
: Generated On: 15/09/2023 ~ Page No: |

*This is 8 compuler system aenerated oavmenl transaction recieot. Hance no nead !or a nhvninal slnnarnra




Librarlan Mangalam College Of Engineering <librarlan@mangalam.in>

: . l" M
d: Payment Status of Knimbus Journal Subscription Fee for MANGALA
COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING

1 message

; | Sat, Sep 16, 2023 at 2 08 PM
incipal MLMCE <princ1pal@mangalam.lné o :
?:nLclb':Znan Mangalam College Of Engineering <librarian@mangalam.in>

Greelings
Or. Vinodh P Vijayan Ph.D | PRINCIPAL

NG MANGALAM

COLLEGE OF ENGINCERING

Vettimukal P O, Mangalam Hills

s

©ME RBCE

Email principal@mangalam.in
vinadh pajayan@mangalam.in
vinodnpyvijayan81@gmail.com
Ph # +91 9961687007
Website: www.miangalam.ac.in

Tel: 0481~2533711, 2533722, 2537053
i<,
e
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f~11 A
(] ket
(¢

—— Forwarded message ----—-—-

From <communicauon_support@k(u.edu.|n> :
C Date: Fr, Sep 15, 2023 al 8:14 PM
Subject: Payment Status of K

0 <r"‘-"-'a!\amrrlemssery@gr

-

nimbus Journal Subscriplion Fee for M
nail.

ANGALAM

£ COLLEGE OfF
oy <r'eem""geo"ge@m'f?ngalam.|n>,,<pr|nclpa|@manga|ar§r\llnG>‘NEERlNG
Dear S|rlMadam.
Thank yoy for making a
payment of INR i
Technoiogical University. ; ——-MZOO_“OO'OOI . Km%
Thanksl

KTU e-Goy Platform sy
ont Team,
APJ Abdul Kala pReL teem

m Technological Universily Technicg| Suppon Team

to the APy Abdul Kalam

S PRINCIPAL _
5’(/ ' MANGALA COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING
gl 2

Berefogill | Ettumanoor
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PAYMENT TRANSACTION RECEIPT

Reference ld: MP_KTU1211890 Date: 15/09/2023

Received with thanks from MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING

anamount of INR 2000000 for  Subscription Fee For Knimbus Journals (E

Journal Subscription For Affiliated Inslitutions 2023-2024 )

[ ]
APJ Abdul Kalam Technological University
()
Q PRINCIPAL
MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING
Ettumanoor
I aled On: 16/09/2023 ‘ " Page R |

I 5 3 cpmniter cuctrm ~ee oo



{ mossnge

| princlpal MUMCE <principal
| Tg Librarian pal@mangalam.in>

Greelings,
Dr. Vinodh P Vijayan Ph.D | PRINCIPAL

@ MANGALAM

'_\.J/‘_Loulul OF ENGINEERING
“ |

vottimukal P O, Mangalam Hllls

Ettumanoor, Kottayam,

} "-».‘iE *5“2\”‘”“

L ) | et . P o,
3 ',:i‘._?). Ll OSE
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2

ME ECE

Email prn‘uupnhg)mnngalaun in
yvinodh pvuuyan@mangalnm in
vunodlquayanﬁ @gmail.com

Ph # +91 9961 687007

Website: wivw, mangalam.ac in

____—-————__5__4.—-———'

Tel: 0481-2533711, 2533722, 2537053

— Forwarded message -~

From: <com
Date: Fri, S€P 15, 2023 at g:11 PM
Subject payment Status of Elsevier Journd

To: <abrahamchemssery@gmail com?,

Dear SyriMadam,

Thank you for making 8 payment of INR 110
Technological University.

Thanks.
KTU e-Gov platform support Team

ApJ Apcul Kalam Technolog!

Mangal
galam College Of Engineering <librarlan@mangalam.in>

e
i ey’

Librarian M
an
galam Collage Of Englneering <librarian@mangalam.in>

wd: Pa ment Status of Else
LLEGE OF ENG\NEERmGVier Journal Subscription Fee for MANGALAM

Sat, Sep 16, 2023 at 2:09 PM

Kerala, Indla-686631

mumcahon_supporl@klu.edu.tn>

| Subscription Fee for MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING
<neema,george@mangalam.im, <prmcipa|@mangalam.in>

000.00/ 8 Elsevier Journal Subscription Fee to the APJ Abdul Kalam
_//"—-:"’_' /’/,—_——————-———-—’"— :

Ti i ;
cal University Technical Suppurt_jfealn.

A VS - pRICIEAL
© MANGALAM COLLECE OF ENGINEERING
gl ‘Ettumanoor
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F. J Abdul Kalam Technological University

PAYMENT TRANSACTION RECEIPT

Reference Id: MP
_KTU1211888 Date:

15/09/2023

Received with thanks from MANGALAM COLLEGE OF ENGINEERING

an amount of INR  110000.00 for

(.‘ I‘& :
33 5
E-Journal Subscription For Affilialed Inslitutions 2023-2024 )

APJ Abdul Kalam Technolog

PRINCIPAL
MANGALAM COLLEGE

Ettumanoor

*raled On: 16/09/2023 ;
2 ; v ! Pase KL 1

Subscription Fee For Elsevier Journ

als (

ical University

OF ENGINEERING
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Kharacpii
7~ National
P Digilal Library
¢ of India

CERTIFICATE OF
REGISTRATION

e of Engineering” is

This is to certify that “Mangalam Colleg |
| Digital Library of India.

registered as a NDLI Club under the Nationa

Registration No.: INKLNCJJVCVXEXP

Date of Registration: 04/08/2021

(—3} Nalional
| 7l [.'_r-'| 12l Labhrary
bl e A1 validity Extended Upto: 04/08/2025
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C%LLEGE OF ENGINEERING
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